

UWCHLAN HILLS ELEMENTARY

GENERAL CONTRACT BIDS

		Skepton Const. Inc	Lobar, Inc.	Hobbs and Co.	E.R. Stuebner	Berg Construction	R.E. Pierson Const.	Boro Const.
Company:		Skepton Const. Inc	Lobar, Inc.	Hobbs and Co.	E.R. Stuebner	Berg Construction	R.E. Pierson Const.	Boro Const.
Base Bid:		\$13,800,000.00	\$14,260,000.00	NO BID	\$13,437,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Alt.#	Alternate Description:							
1	Quartz tile second floor corridors	(\$95,000.00)	(\$74,000.00)		(\$78,000.00)			
2	Quartz tile Multi-purpose room	(\$61,000.00)	(\$48,000.00)		(\$50,000.00)			
3	Proscenium Surround	(\$15,000.00)	(\$4,000.00)		(\$10,000.00)			
4	Ceiling tile in Classrooms	(\$8,000.00)	(\$8,000.00)		(\$12,000.00)			
5	Mulch Playground surface	(\$43,000.00)	(\$53,000.00)		(\$40,000.00)			
6	Grass seed in lieu of Sod	NC	NC		NC			
7	Unclassified site work	NC	\$257,000.00		\$20,000.00			
8	Direct Digital controls	NC	NC		NC			
9	Lightning protection	\$5,000.00	NC		NC			
10	Insulated Safety Glass	\$34,000.00	\$15,000.00		\$3,000.00			
11	Digital Mixing Valves	NC	NC		NC			
12a	Brick Alt. Meridian	(\$16,000.00)	(\$14,100.00)		(\$11,000.00)			
12b	Brick Alt. Unicorn 2	(\$45,000.00)	(\$44,100.00)		(\$60,000.00)			
13	Fixture 'H'	NC	NC		NC			

UWCHLAN HILLS ELEMENTARY

MECHANICAL CONTRACT BIDS

Company:		JBM Mechanical, Inc	Five Star Mechanical	Frey Lutz Corp	Guy M. Cooper, Inc.	Dolan Mechanical, Inc	Myco Mechanical, Inc.	Tri-County Mechanical	Matchline Mechanical LLC	Boro Construction	Bidder's name	Merit Mechanical Inc.
Base Bid:		\$3,391,000.00	\$3,327,000.00	\$3,698,000.00	\$3,655,000.00	NO BID	\$4,360,000.00	NO BID	\$3,700,000.00	\$3,362,000.00	NO BID	\$5,100,000.00
Alt.#	Alternate Description:											
1	Quartz tile second floor corridors	NC	NC		NC		NC		NC	NA		NA
2	Quartz tile Multi-purpose room	NC	NC		NC		NC		NC	NA		NA
3	Proscenium Surround	NC	NC		NC		NC		NC	NA		NA
4	Ceiling tile in Classrooms	NC	NC		NC		NC		NC	NA		NA
5	Mulch Playground surface	NC	NC		NC		NC		NC	NA		NA
6	Grass seed in lieu of Sod	NC	NC		NC		NC		NC	NA		NA
7	Unclassified site work	NC	NC		NC		NC		NC	NA		NA
8	Direct Digital controls	\$20,000.00	(\$150,000.00)	\$50,000.00	\$50,000.00		(\$1,100,000.00)		(\$100,000.00)	(\$100,000.00)		NA
9	Lightning protection	NC	NC		NC		NC		NC	NA		NA
10	Insulated Safety Glass	NC	NC		NC		NC		NC	NA		NA
11	Digital Mixing Valves	NC	NC		NC		NC		NC	NA		NA
12a	Brick Alt. Meridian	NC	NC		NC		NC		NC	NA		NA
12b	Brick Alt. Unicorn 2	NC	NC		NC		NC		NC	NA		NA
13	Fixture 'H'	NC	NC		NC		NC		NC	NA		NA

UWCHLAN HILLS ELEMENTARY

ELECTRICAL CONTRACT BIDS

Company:		Philips Brothers	McGoldrick Electric, Inc.	Pinnacle Electrical Construction	AJM Electric, Inc.	Ford Brothers Electrical Co, Inc.	BSI Electric	MJF Electrical Contracting	Farfield Company	Electri-Tech	Wescott Electric Co	Cyprium Solutions, Inc.	Boro Construction	Hobbs and Co. Inc
Base Bid:		\$2,944,777.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$3,000,000.00	\$3,200,000.00	\$3,288,000.00	\$3,530,000.00	\$3,125,000.00	\$2,600,000.00	\$2,797,000.00	\$3,579,000.00
Alt.#	Alternate Description:													
1	Quartz tile second floor corridors	NA					NC	NO BID	NC	NC	NC	NC	NA	NC
2	Quartz tile Multi-purpose room	NA					NC	NO BID	NC	NC	NC	NC	NA	NC
3	Proscenium Surround	NA					NC	NO BID	NC	NC	NC	NC	NA	NC
4	Ceiling tile in Classrooms	NA					NC	NO BID	NC	NC	NC	NC	NA	NC
5	Mulch Playground surface	NA					NC	NO BID	NC	NC	NC	NC	NA	NC
6	Grass seed in lieu of Sod	NA					NC	NO BID	NC	NC	NC	NC	NA	NC
7	Unclassified site work	\$25,000.00					\$7,500.00	NO BID	\$20,000.00	NC	\$12,000.00	\$33,000.00	\$5,000.00	NC
8	Direct Digital controls	NA					NC	NO BID	NC	NC	NC	NC	NA	NC
9	Lightning protection	\$57,000.00					\$35,400.00	\$40,000.00	\$54,000.00	\$28,700.00	\$35,000.00	\$38,000.00	\$33,000.00	\$40,000.00
10	Insulated Safety Glass	NA					NC	NO BID	NC	NC	NC	NC	NA	NC
11	Digital Mixing Valves	NA					NC	NO BID	NC	NC	NC	NC	NA	NC
12a	Brick Alt. Meridian	NA					NC	NO BID	NC	NC	NC	NC	NA	NC
12b	Brick Alt. Unicorn 2	NA					NC	NO BID	NC	NC	NC	NC	NA	NC
13	Fixture 'H'	\$1,000.00					(\$7,000.00)	(\$18,000.00)	\$29,800.00	(\$4,400.00)	(\$3,000.00)	(\$4,000.00)	NC	(\$28,000.00)

UWCHLAN HILLS ELEMENTARY

PLUMBING CONTRACT BIDS										
	Company:	JBM Mechanical, Inc	Five Star Mechanical	Frey Lutz Corp	Guy M. Cooper, Inc.	Myco Mechanical, Inc.	JAY R. REYNOLDS, INC.	Vision Mechanical Inc	Stan-Roch Plumbing	Merit Mechanical Inc.
	Base Bid:	\$1,318,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$1,462,000.00	\$1,463,000.00	\$1,304,800.00	\$1,349,850.00	\$1,390,000.00	\$2,900,000.00
Alt.#	Alternate Description:									
1	Quartz tile second floor corridors	NC			NC	NA	NC	NC	\$0.00	NA
2	Quartz tile Multi-purpose room	NC			NC	NA	NC	NC	\$0.00	NA
3	Proscenium Surround	NC			NC	NA	NC	NC	\$0.00	NA
4	Ceiling tile in Classrooms	NC			NC	NA	NC	NC	\$0.00	NA
5	Mulch Playground surface	NC			NC	NA	NC	NC	\$0.00	NA
6	Grass seed in lieu of Sod	NC			NC	NA	NC	NC	\$0.00	NA
7	Unclassified site work	NC			NC	NA	NC	NC	\$0.00	NA
8	Direct Digital controls	NCC			NC	NA	NC	NC	\$0.00	NA
9	Lightning protection	NC			NC	NA	NC	NC	\$0.00	NA
10	Insulated Safety Glass	NC			NC	NA	NC	NC	\$0.00	NA
11	Digital Mixing Valves	\$7,000.00			\$7,200.00	(\$1,200.00)	\$4,100.00	NC	\$7,000.00	\$25,000.00
12a	Brick Alt. Meridian	NC			NC	NA	NC	NC	\$0.00	NA
12b	Brick Alt. Unicorn 2	NC			NC	NA	NC	NC	\$0.00	NA
13	Fixture 'H'	NC			NC	NA	NC	NC	\$0.00	\$2,500.00

UWCHLAN HILLS ELEMENTARY

SITE CONTRACT BIDS

SITE CONTRACT BIDS					
	Company:	Highway Materials, Inc	Watts Services, LLC	CHN Site Construction	B. Blair Corporation
	Base Bid:	\$4,641,782.45	\$3,700,000.00	\$4,231,150.00	\$4,829,000.00
Alt.#	Alternate Description:				
1	Quartz tile second floor corridors	NC	NC	NC	NC
2	Quartz tile Multi-purpose room	NC	NC	NC	NC
3	Proscenium Surround	NC	NC	NC	NC
4	Ceiling tile in Classrooms	NC	NC	NC	NC
5	Mulch Playground surface	NC	NC	NC	NC
6	Grass seed in lieu of Sod	(\$4,700.00)	(\$4,700.00)	(\$16,447.71)	(\$5,000.00)
7	Unclassified site work	\$689,667.40	\$150,000.00	\$198,250.00	\$0.00
8	Direct Digital controls	NC	NC	NC	NC
9	Lightning protection	NC	NC	NC	NC
10	Insulated Safety Glass	NC	NC	NC	NC
11	Digital Mixing Valves	NC	NC	NC	NC
12a	Brick Alt. Meridian	NC	NC	NC	NC
12b	Brick Alt. Unicorn 2	NC	NC	NC	NC
13	Fixture 'H'	NC	NC	NC	NC